City of Phenix City
Bid Tabulation

Demolition of Structures 2026-01

Opening Date: February 26, 2026 at 10:00 AM EST

Vendor: Great Southern Furniture
Bid Bond Check

Vendor: Crawford Grading & Pipeline
Bid Bond x Check

Vendor: Elite Hauling & Landworks
Bid Bond x Check

Vendor: BMR-1, LLC
Bid Bond Check x

Item # |DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1 1820 6th Court $4,650.00 $21,280.00 $5,584.50 $12,000.00

2 915 8th Avenue $5,625.00 $20,312.00 $5,168.00 $15,000.00

3 1100 11th Street NO BID $9,532.00 $4,947.00 NO BID

4 1005 15th Place $4,825.00 $22,075.00 $7,369.50 $19,000.00

5 1108 17th Avenue $4,225.00 $8,680.00 $2,856.00 $7,500.00

6 1014 20th Street $2,850.00 $28,576.00 $6,795.75 $15,000.00

7 100 14th Avenue South $2,650.00 $12,075.00 $3,366.00 $5,500.00

8 808 13th Court NO BID $16,135.00 $3,323.50 $15,000.00

9 800 16th Street NO BID $52,075.00 $9,864.25 $40,000 - SLAB REMOVAL

$32,000 - HAULING SHRUB

Department Head Approval

Department Representative

Purchasing Agent

Finance Dept Representative




City of Phenix City
Bid Tabulation

Demolition of Structures 2026-01

Opening Date: February 26, 2026 at 10:00 AM EST

Vendor: J & J Land Development |Vendor: Stubbs & Cook Solutions Vendor: Vendor:
Bid Bond Check Bid Bond x Check Bid Bond Check Bid Bond Check
Item # |DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 1820 6th Court $5,200.00 $8,212.50
2 915 8th Avenue $5,900.00 $7,600.00
3 1100 11th Street $5,400.00 $7,275.00
4 1005 15th Place $6,450.00 $10,856.25
5 1108 17th Avenue $3,800.00 $4,200.00
6 1014 20th Street $6,900.00 $9,993.75
7 100 14th Avenue South $3,250.00 $4,950.00
8 808 13th Court $3,900.00 $4,887.50
9 800 16th Street $9,800 - LEAVE SLAB $27,950 - w/o SLAB REMOVAL

$2,000 - SLAB REMOVAL

Department Head Approval

Department Representative

Purchasing Agent

Finance Dept Representative




