PHENIX-CITY
UTIERTIES DEPARTMENS

Al - =
‘\ / P oy, AL 3saar | M e o Al 3666s | Ph:334-4482880 | Fx:33429+4742 | phenixcibyalus
DR. R. GRIFF GORDY STEVE BAILEY EDDIE N. LOWE VICKEY CARTER JOHNSON ARTHUR L. DAY, JR.
Mayor Pro Tem / At Large Councilmember District 1 Mayor Councilmember District 2 Councilmember District 3

WALLACE B. HUNTER, City Manager
MELONY LEE, City Clerk
CHARLES D. WOODY I, Utilities Director

BID FORM
THIS IS AN INQUIRY - NOT AN ORDER

Date: June 21,2022 Bids Close On: September 8,2022 Time: _2:00 p.m. Eastern Standard Time

Bids to be delivered to: Finance Department, City of Phenix City, Alabama, 601 12t Street, Second Floor, Phenix City, Alabama 36867

Please quote us prices on the articles or services listed below. The right is reserved to accept or reject all or any part of your offer, and to accept the offer the
City Council considers the most advantageous to the City. Any suggestions as to quantity to secure a better price are welcome.

Item No. Quantity ltem Unit Price Total
Please see attached documents

BIDS MUST BE RETURNED IN A SEALED ENVELOPE TO THE ADDRESS ABOVE. MARKED: UT22-03: Phenix City Utilities Dept. — Chemical Bid

IF YOU MAIL YOUR BID BY FED EX OR AIRBORNE, ETC., PLEASE WRITE ON THE ENVELOPE ALSO: UT22-03: Phenix City Utilities Dept. - Chemical
Bid

NO BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED AFTER __2:00 p.m. EST , ON THE BID OPENING DATE. PLEASE NOTE THAT THE TIME IS EASTERN (GEORGIA).
BIDS WILL BE OPENED IN THE MARTIN IDLE HOUR PARK COMMUNITY CENTER LOCATED AT 3743 MOON LAKE DRIVE, PHENIX CITY, ALABAMA.

FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION, CALL: Jared Barker (WWTP) at 334-291-4736 or Mike Smisek (WFP) at 334-291-4757.

GENERAL CONDITIONS OF BIDDING - READ CAREFULLY
Quote on alternates if unable to furnish items listed. State on face of bid exactly what you are furnishing. (Brand or Manufacturer's Name).
Any catalog, or manufacturer’s reference in this proposal is descriptive, but not restrictive, and is used only to indicate type and grade.
Furnish specifications on all items bid.
The City of Phenix City is exempt from all Federal Excise Taxes. DO NOT include tax in your bid price or invoice.
PRICE MUST BE ITEMIZED. The City of Phenix City reserves the right to award item or total bid.
ALL bids must be quoted f.0.b. Phenix City.
In case of a discrepancy between the unit price and the extension, the unit price will be taken.
Due to legal requirements of the City for processing payments, cash discounts should be quoted ten days after end of month, when possible.
In the event no bid is to be submitted note same on invitation and return with the general provisions included herein. Also advise whether future
invitations for type of supplies or services covered by the inquiry are desired.
10.  The successful bidder will be required to have all applicable state and city business licenses.
11.  This original request for proposal, along with any attachments, MUST BE SUBMITTED IN DUPLICATE.
12. A 5% bid bond or cashier’s check must be submitted with all bids.

©OoNSOTRA N =

The undersigned hereby offers to furnish and deliver the articles or services as specified above at the prices and terms there stated and in strict accordance
with the specifications and general conditions of bidding, all of which are made a part of this offer. This offer is not subject to withdrawal.

Delivery can be made Cash discount % Days

Name of Business

By:

Authorized Representative - Must sign by hand

Business Telephone:
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BID NOTICE: UT22-03 CHEMCIAL BID

THE CITY OF PHENIX CITY/UTILITIES DEPARTMENT

Councilmember District 3

TO OPEN THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 8TH, 2022 @ 2:00 PM EASTERN STANDARD TIME

The City of Phenix City/Utilities Department will be soliciting bids for the following:

Item Quantity
No. Item Unit | Estimates | Unit Price
1 | Liquid Chlorine ( WWTP & WFP) tons 90
2 | Sulfur Dioxide (WWTP) tons 10
3 | Dry Polymer (WWTP) Ibs 5,000
4 | Liquid Polymer (WWTP) Ibs 92,000
5 | Aluminum Sulfate (WFP) Ibs 400,000
6 | Granular Soda Ash (WFP) Ibs 525,000
7 | Hydroflousilicic Acid (WFP) Ibs 60,000
8 | Poly Aluminum Chloride (WFP) Ibs 400,000

Bids must be submitted on the bid form in a sealed envelope marked:

UT22-03 Phenix City Utilities Dept./ Chemical Bid

Bids must be submitted no later than Thursday, September 8", 2022 at 1:30 PM EASTERN at:

Phenix City Finance Department
Attn: Purchasing Agent

601 12" Street, Second Floor
Phenix City, Alabama 36867

Bids will be opened in the Martin — Idle Hour Community Center 3743 Moon Lake Drive, Phenix
City, Alabama 36867.

No bidder may withdraw his bid within 90 days after the opening thereof.
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The City reserves the right to waive any informalities, or to reject any or all bids, and to award the
contract to the best and most responsible bidder.

A 5% bid bond or cashier’s check must be submitted with all bids in order for your bid to
be considered.

For additional information or copies of the bid form and/or specifications, contact Jared Barker
(WWTP) at 334-291-4736 or Mike Smisek (WFP) at 334-291-4757.
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CITY OF PHENIX CITY
BID TABULATION: UT21-01 CHEMICALS
BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 9, 2021 @ 10:00 AM EST

Vendor: Vendor: Vendor: Vendor:
CHEM TRADE SOLENIS G20 TECHNOLOGIES, LLC. CEDARCHEM, LLC.
BidBond___ v Check___ BidBond ___ v Check___ BidBond___ v__ Check__ BidBond___ v Check___
Quantity
Item No. Item Unit Estimates Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Liquid Chlorine (WWTP & WFP) tons 90
2 Sulfur Dioxide (WWTP) tons 10
$2.07 / LB DELIVERED
$2.33 LB Yearly total / Extended price =
3 Dry Polymer (WWTP) lbs 9,000 $18,630
$1.73 / NEAT POUND $1.44 / LB DELIVERED
*40% active $1.73 neat pound / Yearly total / Extended price =
4 Liquid Polymer (WWTP) 1bs 73,600 40% = $4.33 / active pound $105,984
$0.1875 / DRY LB.
*For conversion purposes only, $0.1785 / DRY LB
price equates to $375.00 per dry ($357.00 / dry ton)
5 Aluminum Sulfate (WFP) lbs 400,000 ton
6 Granular Soda Ash (WFP) Ibs 525,000
7 Hydroflousilicic Acid (WFP) lbs 60,000
$0.218 / LB DELIVERED
Yearly total / Extended price =
8 Poly Aluminum Chloride (WFP) Ibs 400,000 $87,200
Vendor: Vendor: Vendor: Vendor:
BRENNTAG MID-SOUTH, INC. C & S CHEMICALS SNF POLYDYNE HARCROS CHEMICALS, INC.
BidBond ___v'__ Check ___ BidBond___v'__ Check ___ BidBond ___v'__ Check ___ BidBond___v'__ Check ___
Quantity
Item No. Item Unit Estimates Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Liquid Chlorine (WWTP & WFP) tons 90 $1,440.00 NO BID
2 Sulfur Dioxide (WWTP) tons 10 $1,100.00 NO BID
3 Dry Polymer (WWTP) 1bs 9,000 $2.158 NO BID
4 Liquid Polymer (WWTP) lbs 73,600 $1.40 NO BID
5 Aluminum Sulfate (WFP) lbs 400,000 $0.159 / DRY LB NO BID
6 Granular Soda Ash (WFP) Ibs 525,000 NO BID $0.1739 /LB
$0.91304 / DRY LB
7 Hydroflousilicic Acid (WFP) lbs 60,000 $1.03 NO BID Harcros Chemicals
8 Poly Aluminum Chloride (WFP) lbs 400,000 NO BID

DEPARTMENT REPRESENTATIVE DEPARTMENT HEAD WITNESS APPROVAL UT21-01: Chemicals
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City of Phenix City
Specifications for Bid# UT22-03

Liquid Chlorine
And
Sulfur Dioxide

I. General Terms and Conditions

a. Except as otherwise provided in this contract, the City of Phenix City shall order
from the Contractor all Chlorine and Sulfur Dioxide required to be purchased by
the City of Phenix City during the contract period.

b. Within 5 business days of being awarded the bid, the successful bidder shall
acquire a City of Phenix City business license. If the successful bidder does not
acquire said business license within 5 business days of being awarded the bid,
said bidder shall lose the bid and the City of Phenix City shall award the bid the
next successful bidder.

c. Itis estimated that 90 tons of chlorine and 10 tons of Sulfur Dioxide will be
required in the operation of the Water Filtration Plant (WFP) and Waste Water
Treatment Plant (WWTP) during the period October 1, 2022 — September 30,
2023. Exact quantities cannot now be determined, but estimates are given.
Quantities listed may be increased or decreased to meet the requirements of the
City of Phenix City during the contract period. A minimum is not guaranteed.

d. A purchase order for the period of October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023
inclusive will be awarded as a result of this invitation for bid. The City of Phenix
City will issue verbal release orders for each shipment under the contract. Prices
quoted shall not change for the entire term of the contract.

e. Product shall be delivered in one (1) Ton net weight containers to either the City
of Phenix City WFP (1100 32" St. Phenix City, Al. 36867) or WWTP (1600 East
State Docks Rd. Phenix City, Al. 36869) as directed within five (5) days
following the request for each delivery. Deliveries shall include unloading of said
containers at the WFP dock and/or under the WWTP monorail crane system.
Deliveries will be accepted only between the hours of 8:00am EST through
2:30pm EST. Monday through Friday (No Exceptions).
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f. The City of Phenix City will receive chlorine and sulfur dioxide only under the
following conditions:

i. The delivery truck must be equipped with hoisting capabilities and the
delivery driver will be responsible for off-loading the containers onto
the dock or under the monorail system. The delivery dri-ver must be
familiar with the hoisting equipment and be able to safely off-load the
containers. Any unsafe off-loading conditions will be grounds for rejection
of the shipment.

ii. A shipment of containers using a chain boom for securing the containers
on the truck will be rejected if the chain boom cannot be released by hand
without the aid of a "cheater pipe."”

iii. Containers will be inspected upon delivery. The containers will be off-
loaded onto the dock. The valve covers (bonnets) will be removed by the
operators and the valves inspected for leaks.

iv. Each valve cap on each container will be loosened and the valve re-tested
for leaks. The container will also be inspected for physical damage. This
includes any corrosion that is noticeable around the valve or fittings.

v. The Risk Management Program (RMP) requires that a container will be
returned if the container:

1. Has physical damage
2. Has a valve that has a leak under the valve cap and the leak cannot
stop by retightening the cap

vi. Should a container have a leak that cannot be secured for return, the
container will be secured at the dock using the plant's "B" kit. The
contractor will be required to remediate the defective container.

g. The City of Phenix City reserves the right to purchase Chlorine and Sulfur
Dioxide from another source if successful bidder is unable to deliver Chlorine or
Sulfur Dioxide within five (5) business days of the date of the order.

h. The Contract may be canceled by either party with 30 days by written notice for
failure to comply with the provisions of this contract.

i. Bids will be considered only from manufacturers or their authorized distributors.
The authorized distributors must regularly maintain a substantial stock of the
Chlorine and Sulfur Dioxide bid upon and must be actively engaged in the sale of
Chlorine and Sulfur Dioxide. Such stock and facilities may be examined by a
representative of the City of Phenix City at any time either before award is made
or during the life of the contract.

J. The City of Phenix City reserves the right to reject any and all bids or portions of
bids, waive formalities and to make such award of contract as may be deemed to
be the most advantageous for the City of Phenix City. No bids may be withdrawn
within thirty (30) days after date of opening.
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k. Any required deposits, container fees or other special fees shall be noted on the
proposal.

I.  The contractor will provide documentation on its driver training program
developed to ensure they fully understand the safety and health hazards of the
hazardous substances they are delivering and the handling equipment they operate
in order to protect themselves, the City’s staff, citizens living near the facility, and
the environment.

m. The contractor shall provide documentation on its hoist equipment inspection and
maintenance program developed to assure the hoist is maintained according to the
manufacturers and OSHA standards. In addition, the contractor shall provide
documentation that their drivers are certified to use their hoist equipment and that
the training, certification and maintenance documentation is up to date.

n. The supplier shall furnish Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) for the specified
chlorine and sulfur dioxide immediately upon the first delivery. The MSDS shall
be updated as required by law or if warranted by any manufacturer or product
change.

Il.  Specifications for Liquid Chlorine

a. Chlorine bid must be in compliance with AWWA B301, Standard for Liquid
Chlorine.

b. Bidder must include with the bid submitted an Affidavit stating that the liquid
chlorine furnished under this contract complies with all applicable standards and
requirements of AWWA B301, Standard for Liquid Chlorine.

c. NSF 60 approved with documentation supplied with each shipment.

d. Purity: 99.5% chlorine minimum

e. Water: 50 parts per million (ppm) maximum

I11.  Specifications for Sulfur Dioxide
a. Sulfur dioxide shall meet requirements of AWWA Standard B512-08.
b. Chemical Analysis

Product makeup Guaranteed Typical
SOz 99.9% Minimum 99.99%
Water 100 ppm Maximum 70 ppm
Nonvolatile 50 ppm Maximum 6 ppm
SOs 10 ppm Maximum 1 ppm
Elemental Sulfur 10 ppm Maximum 5 ppm
Total Metals 30 ppm Maximum

Pb 10 ppm

Fe 10 ppm

As 3 ppm

Se 3 ppm

Page | 3
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IV. Insurance Requirements
a. The Supplier will be required to furnish the City with the following insurance
policies prior to final award of contract:
I. Workman’s Compensation Statutory Limits

ii. General Liability
1. $500,000/bodily injury
2. $100,000/property damage
3. $250,000/each person

iii. Auto Public Liability
1. $250,000/person
2. $500,000/accident or occurrence
3. $100,000/property damage

iv. Product Liability
1. $1,000,000/occurrence

V. Information
a. For information in responding to this Invitation for Bids, prospective bidders may
contact the City of Phenix City Finance Department by phone at (334) 448-2729
or by emailing purchasing@phenixcityal.us.
b. To be considered, bids must be received at the City of Phenix City’s Purchasing
Office.
c. Schedule:
i. Mail out specs Monday, June 7, 2022
ii. Bids are due to the City by 1:30 pm on Thursday, September 8", 2022
iii. Award the bids on September 20™", 2022

VI. Bid:
Chlorine $ Ton Sulfur Dioxide $ Ton
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City of Phenix City
Specifications for Bid# UT22-03

Dry and Liquid Polymer for the WWTP Belt Press and RDT’s

The City of Phenix City Waste Water Treatment Plant (WWTP) will be using dry and liquid
polymers. The following criteria will be used in evaluating proposals sent back to the City of
Phenix City:

1)

2)

3)

4)

5)

6)

Except as otherwise provided in this contract, during the contract period, the City of
Phenix City shall purchase all polymer for the WWTP Belt Press and Rotary Drum
Thickerner (RDT) Andritz Units from the Contractor.

Within 5 business days of being awarded the bid, the successful bidder shall acquire a
City of Phenix City business license. If the successful bidder does not acquire said
business license within 5 business days of being awarded the bid, said bidder shall lose
the bid and the City of Phenix City shall award the bid the next successful bidder.

It is estimated that 5,000Ibs of Dry Polymer and 92,000Ibs of Liquid Polymer will be
required in the operation of the Waste Water Treatment Plant (WWTP) during the period
October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023. Exact quantities cannot now be determined, but
estimates are given. Quantities listed may be increased or decreased to meet the
requirements of the City of Phenix City during the contract period. A minimum is not
guaranteed.

A purchase order will be awarded as a result of this invitation for bid for the time period
from when the bid is awarded on October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023. The City of
Phenix City will issue verbal release orders for each shipment under the contract. Prices
quoted shall not change for the entire term of the contract.

(Dry Polymer) There is one 2.2 meter belt filter press being utilized for sludge
dewatering. Each proposed polymer is to be evaluated and supporting data submitted to
specified City personnel to determine the most economical polymer or polymers that
produce a final cake with optimum solids content of 20%, while maintaining a minimum
sludge production rate through the press of 1 ton per hour.

(Liquid Polymer) There is (2) RDT’s Andritz Units for thickening the Primary Sludge
and Waste Activated Sludge (WAS). Samples of sludge (Primary Sludge and WAS) shall
be present for jar testing. The City will be looking at the following criteria for the liquid
polymer:
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Emulsion polymer with the lowest cost $/dry ton while maintaining 5-6% T.S.
thickened solids concentration and 98% Solids recovery.

Liquid polymer totes may be one-way or round trip totes but shall not exceed a total
weight of 30001bs each.

7) All proposed polymers must be tested and qualified by the City following the submittal of

proposals. The qualification process shall include but not be limited to the following:
a. Product Selection: The City shall select one polymer for the contract term.

However, vendors may propose a maximum of 2 polymers for qualification
testing. The proposed polymer (Dry) shall be quoted at unit cost per pound and
(Liquid) at pounds of active polymer listed on the bid sheet times (x) bid price per
pound of active polymer equals (=) total cost of active polymer per year. The City
will use the following to determine the total contract cost for the polymer bid:

i. Dosage in pounds per dry ton
ii. Suspended Solids from the press filtrate
iii. Gallons per hour of sludge treated
iv. % Solids of Sludge Cake
v. Cost of polymer per a dry ton of solids

Laboratory Testing: All bidders shall arrange for site testing of their products for
the purpose of determining which products they intend to bid on. Testing shall be
limited to jar testing only. Contact Cody Gray or Jared Barker at 334-291-4736.
The WWTP will provide laboratory space for all vendors to test their polymers
prior to proposal due date. It will be the responsibility of the vendors to determine
the best polymer or polymers they have available for the conditioning of the
sludge.

The Qualification Test: All testing shall take place during the time period of
Monday, June 14, 2022 — Thursday, September 3, 2022. However if a
prospective bidder’s proposed product arrives at the treatment plant prior to the
product prequalification startup date. The vendor may request from the Treatment
Plant Superintendent to start their testing process early and these requests will be
granted if operating conditions so permit. No time extension will be granted for
the test process unless equipment failures, process upsets or other conditions
within the treatment plant beyond control of the vendor prevent completion of the
scheduled test. In that event the test will be rescheduled for the first available
production day.

Prospective bidders shall be assigned laboratory and field test schedules on a first
come first serve basis. Each vendor will be granted a maximum of 1 day of test
time for each product tested for a maximum of four days to complete the tests.
There will be no exception to this requirement. Vendors are urged to contact the
City as soon as possible to assure acceptable test period scheduling.
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e. The field testing of polymers will be performed and evaluated by City personnel
only. No exceptions to this condition will be granted. Each polymer will be tested
equally under the same test conditions with no deviation from stated test
conditions during the test period. A vendor representative may be present to
witness the test procedure and answer any questions the City may have for
handling of their product. The vendor will not take part in the actual test
procedure. Note: All tests will be performed Monday — Friday from 8:00 am EST
—2:00pm EST.

8) The vendor will be responsible for providing the following at no cost to the City:
a. Polymers in necessary guantities (501Ib bags, dry or 5 gal pales, liquid only) for
the duration of the test period. There shall be no exception to this requirement.
b. The supplier will provide all polymers for these tests. Our experience indicates
that approximately 50 Ibs. will be necessary for a day’s run.
c. Any shipping cost to and from the City test location.

9) Vendors will become qualified when their product demonstrates the following:

a. Must produce a dewatered sludge cake of a minimum of 20% solids. Polymers
that fail to meet these requirements will not be considered.

b. Sludge cake dewatering rate greater than 8.000 Ibs. /hr.

c. Each vendor will be granted 1 testing day per product tested. Feed rate will be
based on the percent of dry solids feed, the pump capacity, and the percent speed.
Samples will be grabbed after stabilization to determine the average cake of solids
and % capture at flow rate. Polymer usage will be measured by scale to determine
polymer dose at each flow rate.

d. Each vendor must submit a Certificate of Analysis that includes active product
concentration.

10) The vendor shall agree to provide the services of the field representative for on-site
performance evaluation and consultation when requested. The vendor shall provide the
City with names of two company maintenance personnel, along with two contact
numbers who are available for emergency situations. The vendor shall provide the City
with all product related safety information and MSDS.

11) The intent of the City is to purchase and use the successful vendor’s product throughout
the period designated. However, regulatory requirements and changes in sludge
characteristics may justify the need to consider other products. If so, the current supplier
will first be given the opportunity to provide alternate products at or below the current
cost. If this cannot be accomplished, the City of Phenix City reserves the right to use the
next lowest vendor from the bids placed and the product they bided will be requested for
an alternate. Issuance of an evaluation and Purchase Order for the polymer(s) specified in
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this document is not intended to prevent the evaluation and purchase of additional
products.

12) The successful vendor shall cooperate with the City of Phenix City in supplying any
quantity of product that is needed or requested. The City of Phenix City reserves the right
to refuse, delay or limit delivery at the time of delivery. The City of Phenix City will not
be responsible to pay demurrage for any reason. The vendor shall supply Polymer within
a lead time of 10 business days of when the order is placed.

13) Schedule:
a. Monday, June 7, 2021: Mail Specifications
b. Monday, June 14, 2021 — Thursday, September 3, 2022: Testing
c. Thursday, September 8, 2022, 10:00am Eastern: Bids Due
d. October 5, 2022: Award Bid

14) Bid Price: per pound (Dry)

per pounds of active polymer listed on the bid sheet times
(x) bid price per pound of active polymer equals (=) total cost of active polymer per year
(Liquid)

15) Information
a. For information in responding to this Invitation for Bids prospective bidders may
contact the City of Phenix City Finance Department at (334) 448-2729 or by
emailing purchasing@phenixcityal.us.
b. To be considered, bids must be received at the City of Phenix City’s Purchasing
Office.
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City of Phenix City
Specifications for Bid# UT22-03

Aluminum Sulfate

I. General Terms and Conditions

1.

Except as otherwise provided in this contract, the City of Phenix City shall order
from the Contractor all Aluminum Sulfate required to be purchased by the City
of Phenix City during the contract period. The vendor will be responsible to get a
business license with the city.

It is estimated that 400,000 Ibs. of Aluminum Sulfate will be required in the
operation of the Water Filtration Plant during the period October 1, 2022 —
September 30, 2023. Exact quantities cannot now be determined, but estimates
are given. Quantities listed may be increased or decreased to meet the
requirements of the City of Phenix City during the contract period. A minimum
is not guaranteed.

A purchase order for the period of October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023
inclusive will be awarded as a result of this invitation for bid. Prices quoted shall
remain firm for the entire term of the contract.

Deliveries are to be made to the City of Phenix City Water Filtration Plant within
5 days following request for each delivery. Deliveries will be accepted only
between the hours of 8:00 am through 2:00 pm est. Monday through Friday (No
Exceptions).

The City of Phenix City reserves the right to purchase Aluminum Sulfate from
another source if successful bidder is unable to deliver within the specified
delivery time.

The Aluminum Sulfate must be bid in Ibs. dry weight, bids based on Gallons
will not be accepted.
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Mayor Pro Tem / At Large

WALLACE B. HUNTER, City Manager
MELONY LEE, City Clerk
CHARLES D. WOODY I, Utilities Director
City of Phenix City
Specifications for Bid# UT22-03
Soda Ash

Granular Soda Ash (Sodium Carbonate Anhydrous)

|. General Terms and Conditions

1.

Except as otherwise provided in this contract, the City of Phenix City shall order
from the Contractor all Soda Ash required to be purchased by the City of Phenix
City during the contract period. The vendor will be responsible to get a business
license with the city.

It is estimated that 700,000 Ibs. of Soda Ash will be required in the operation of
the Water Filtration Plant during the period October 1, 2022- September 30,
2023. Exact quantities cannot now be determined, but estimates are given.
Quantities listed may be increased or decreased to meet the requirements of the
City of Phenix City during the contract period. A minimum is not guaranteed.

A purchase order for the period of October 1, 2022- September 30, 2023
inclusive will be awarded as a result of this invitation for bid. Prices quoted shall
remain firm for the entire term of the contract.

Deliveries are too be made to the City of Phenix City Water Filtration Plant
within 5 days following request for each delivery. Deliveries will be accepted
only between the hours of 8:00 am through 2:00 pm est. Monday through Friday
(No Exceptions).

The City of Phenix City reserves the right to purchase Soda Ash from another
source if successful bidder is unable to deliver within the specified delivery time.

The Soda Ash must_be bid in Ibs. dry weight.
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City of Phenix City
Specifications for Bid# UT22-03

Hydrofluosilicic Acid

|. General Terms and Conditions

1.

Except as otherwise provided in this contract, the City of Phenix City shall order
from the Contractor all Hydrofluosilicic Acid required to be purchased by the
City of Phenix City during the contract period. The vendor will be responsible to
get a business license with the city.

It is estimated that 100,000 Ibs. of Hydrofluosilicic Acid will be required in the
operation of the Water Filtration Plant during the period October 1 2022-
September 30, 2023. Exact quantities cannot now be determined, but estimates
are given. Quantities listed may be increased or decreased to meet the
requirements of the City of Phenix City during the contract period. A minimum
is not guaranteed.

A purchase order for the period of October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023
inclusive will be awarded as a result of this invitation for bid. Prices quoted shall
remain firm for the entire term of the contract.

Deliveries are too be made to the City of Phenix City Water Filtration Plant
within 5 days following request for each delivery. Deliveries will be accepted
only between the hours of 8:00 am through 2:00 pm est. Monday through Friday
(No Exceptions).

The City of Phenix City reserves the right to purchase Hydrofluosilicic Acid
from another source if successful bidder is unable to deliver within the specified
delivery time.

The Hydrofluosilicic Acid must be bid in Ibs. dry weight.
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City of Phenix City
Specifications for Bid# UT22-03

Poly Aluminum Chloride

|. General Terms and Conditions

1.

Except as otherwise provided in this contract, the City of Phenix City shall order
from the Contractor all Poly Aluminum Chloride (PAC) required to be purchased
by the City of Phenix City during the contract period. The vendor will be
responsible to get a business license with the city.

It is estimated that 400,000 Ibs. of PAC will be required in the operation of the
Water Filtration Plant during the period October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023.
Exact quantities cannot now be determined, but estimates are given. Quantities
listed may be increased or decreased to meet the requirements of the City of
Phenix City during the contract period. A minimum is not guaranteed.

A purchase order for the period of October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023
inclusive will be awarded as a result of this invitation for bid. Prices quoted shall
remain firm for the entire term of the contract.

Deliveries are to be made to the City of Phenix City Water Filtration Plant within
5 days following request for each delivery. Deliveries will be accepted only
between the hours of 8:00 am through 2:00 pm est. Monday through Friday (No
Exceptions).

The City of Phenix City reserves the right to purchase PAC from another source
if successful bidder is unable to deliver within the specified delivery time.

The PAC must be bid in Ibs. dry weight, bids based on Gallons will not be
accepted.
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